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CHANGE 

Americanism Chair Mark Hyde 

introduced the candidates who were in 

attendance.  Only opposed candidates 

were allowed to speak to the club.  

Candidates in attendance were Shirley 

Fleming and Brockley Moore.  Mr. 

Moore is unopposed so he was there 

only to 

support 

the           

activity.  

Ms. 

Fleming 

spoke to 

the club 

members 

a            
discussed 

what her 

goals 

and                

objec-

tives are 

for the City of Killeen, District One.  

She addressed her concerns and her 

reasons for seeking public office.  She 

then spent several minutes answering 

the questions from the club members.  

Ms. Fleming’s opponent did not at-

tend.  The two District Four candi-

dates,           Councilmember Terry 

Clark and Jim Kilpatrick were also not 

in attendance. 
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GET OUT THE 

VOTE PROGRAM 

Political Forum 

Killeen City 

Council Elections 
Left to Right: Killeen 

ISD Place 7 candidate 

Jo Ann Purser, CTC 

Place 5 candidates 

Scott Isdale and Dan 

Corbin. Killeen ISD 

Place 7 candidate Lan 

Carter was unable to 

attend.  

Dates To Remember............ 

APRIL 16-17-18—SANDY’S LONE STAR QUE 4 KIDS FUNDRAISER 

APRIL 13—YOUTH OF THE YEAR AND ACE AWARDS LUNCHEON 

APRIL 4—BELIEVE IN THE BLUE FAIR—ROSEWOOD 10-2:30 

APRIL 6—YOUTH OF THE SEMESTER 

APRIL 20—CELEBRATE EXCHANGE CLUB OF KILLEEN’S 60TH 

 

 

GET OUT THE VOTE PROGRAM 

Political Forum Central Texas College 

and Killeen ISD Office seekers 



 

OFFICERS   

DIRECTORS 

and Committee Chairs  

2014-2015 
President....................Charlie Guidry 

President-Elect.........Peggy Murphey 

Secretary...................Christa Hudson 

Treasurer……….......Maureen Jouett 

VP/Bingo.........................Don Sutton 

Scrapbook……….…...Barbara West 

Photographer……………Lan Carter 

Web Master……..….. Larry Holly  

Imm. Past President….. Larry Holly 

Committees: 
Americanism..................Mark Hyde 

Child Abuse Prevention ...…Nancy 

LeChuga 

Community Svc ...........Kathy Jones  

Fellowship/Inter-Club/Public 

Relations/Bulletin..........Kathy Jones  

Membership…….…..Kenny Murray 

Youth………......Angenet Wilkerson 

Directors: 

Diane Guidry, Nancy LeChuga, 

Kathy Clark Jones, Kenny Murray, 

Ursula Rushing, and Barbara West 

 Calendar of Events 

April 2015 

6th—Youth of the Semester—

Angenet Wilkerson Chair 

13th—Youth of the Year & ACE 

Angenet Wilkerson Chair 

20th  - Elections & Come Party 

and Celebrate our 60th 

Anniversary 

27th Aware Central Texas 

Who’s In Charge? 
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April 

Club  

Anniversaries: 
Ronald Stepp 4-1-85 

Shirley LaTour 4-3-12 

Raye Mayhorn 4-3-12 

Ursula Rushing 4-24-12 

Steve Murphey 4-24-13 
 

April Birthdays: 
Kenny Murray 4-18 

Geraldine Lorio 4-25 

 

Biblical 
Exchange 
For we are what he 

has made us, created 

in Christ Jesus for good works, 

which God prepared beforehand 

to be our way of life. 

Ephesians 2:10 

GET OUT THE 

VOTE PROGRAM 

Purpose: 
The Fifteenth, Nineteenth, and 
Twenty-sixth  Amendments to 
the United States Constitution           
established the right to vote for 
all American citizens of                 
minimum age 18. The National 
Exchange Club’s Get Out the 
Vote Program gives our clubs 
the opportunities to not only       
remind their community mem-
bers of their right to vote, but 
also their responsibility to vote. 
The Get Out the Vote Program 
is structured to encourage all 
citizens to exercise their right 
and responsibility by                 
registering to vote and by 
voting for the candidates of 
their choice on election days or 
through absentee ballots. The 
program is not for promoting 
individual candidates for office. 
Get Out the Vote is most often 
coordinated by an Exchange 
Club’s Americanism or                
Community Service Committee. 
Exchange Education from the 
National Exchange Club           
Handbook.  

Above:  Former Mayor of Killeen Dan 

Corbin addresses the attendees at the 

political forum.  He is running for 

Place 5 on the Central Texas Board of 

Trustees. 

 

Right: Dr. Scott Isdale answers ques-

tions at the political forum.  He is the 

incumbent Place 5 Trustee. 


